
 
  
 

 
 
 

South Asia Development Report, April 2024 
 

The World Bank projects South Asia is expected to remain the world’s fastest-growing 
region, thanks to robust growth in India 

 
According to the South Asia Development Update Report of the World Bank, April 2024, in 
South Asia, output growth has surprised on the upside and remains stronger than in other 
emerging market and developing economies (EMDEs). This is largely a consequence of 
India’s robust economic expansion. Output growth in South Asia has continued to exceed 
that in other EMDEs, largely reflecting a strong expansion in India. 
 
Output growth in South Asia, projected at 6.0–6.1 percent in 2024–25 as growth in India 
remains robust, and Pakistan and Sri Lanka continue to recover from balance-of-payments 
challenges (table 1.1). 
 

 
 
Outlook for India  
 
In India, output growth is projected to reach 7.5 percent in FY 2023/24 on the back of robust 
growth in Q3 of FY 2023/24. Growth is expected to moderate to 6.6 percent in FY 2024/25 
before picking up in subsequent years as a decade of robust public investment yields growth 
dividends. 
 



In India, economic activity surprised on the upside in 2023Q4, with growth of 8.4 percent 
from a year ago. The expansion was supported by rapid increases in investment and 
government consumption.  
 
In February, India’s composite purchasing managers index (PMI) stood at 60.6, well above 
the global average of 52.1 (a value above 50 indicates expansion). Growth in FY 2023/24 is 
estimated to have exceeded earlier forecasts.  
 
In India, inflation has remained within the Reserve Bank of India’s 2–6 percent target range 
since a spike in mid-2023, and the policy rate has remained unchanged since February 
2023.  
 
In India, financial conditions have remained accommodative. Domestic credit issuance to 
the commercial sector (including public and private borrowers) grew by 14 percent (year-
on-year) in December 2023, the fastest pace since 2013. The nonperforming-loan ratio fell 
to 3.2  percent last year, well below its recent peak, in March 2018, of about 11 percent. 
 
The report concludes that the growth impact of global uncertainties on South Asia overall 
would likely be limited because of the resilience of India. The report identifies the 
various  policy challenges ahead. These include raising substantial revenues, building climate 
resilience, creating jobs to reap demographic dividend and removing distortions in the 
financial system.  
 
To read the complete report, please click the link below: 
https://openknowledge.worldbank.org/server/api/core/bitstreams/4ec19c2d-65fd-4523-
8020-338f0cb98523/content 
 
For any query related to this mail, please contact Ms. Reema Jain, Research Officer at 
reema.jain@phdcci.in, Ms Nishika Chauhan, Research Associate at 
nishika.chauhan@phdcci.in, and Ms. Mansi Nautiyal, Research Associate at 
mansi.nautiyal@phdcci.in with a cc to Dr S P Sharma, Chief Economist | DSG at 
spsharma@phdcci.in  and chiefeconomist@phdcci.in 
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