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India is the world's third-largest energy consuming country, thanks to 
rising incomes and improving standards of living. As India recovers from 
a Covid-induced slump in 2020, it is re-entering a very dynamic period in 
its energy development.India's oil demand in total primary energy is 
projected to increase from 233 Million ton of oil equivalent (Mtoe) in 
2018 to 305 Mtoe in 2025, as per the World Energy Outlook , published 
by International Energy Agency. India's growing energy needs will also 
make it more reliant on fossil fuel imports. 

Government has taken several steps to enhance exploration & 
production of oil and gas, give thrust on demand substitution, promote 
energy efficiency and conservation, capitalize untapped potential on 
biofuels and alternative fuels/renewables in order to reduce imports of 
crude oil. These include a series of initiatives such as Policy for 
Relaxations, Extensions and Clarifications under Production Sharing 
Contract (PSC) regime for early monetization of hydrocarbon 
discoveries, Discovered Small Field Policy, Hydrocarbon Exploration and 
Licensing Policy.

Regards,
Dr. Jatindar Singh

Against this backdrop, PHD Chamber is organizing a“National Refining 
& Petrochemical Conclave 2021” on 14th September 2021, at 11.00 
A.M. The objective of this webinar is to bring together the different 
stakeholders and discuss the future of refineries, deep water 
operations, Ease of doing business and the opportunities in India. The 
webinar will also provide a platform to adapt best practices and 
noteworthy projects.

A large number of delegates from Industry, senior officials from Central 
and State Governments, Technology providers, Policy Makers, Thought 
Leaders, Financial Institutions, etc. are expected to attend the subject 
Conclave.

I feel honored in inviting you to join the Conclave or nominate senior 
officials from your organization to attend the same. Your presence and 
inputs will greatly enrich the deliberations. 
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